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Enhanced Weathering (EW) of silicate rocks is a carbon 
dioxide (CO2) removal strategy whereby powdered rock is 
applied to the land and/or ocean such that climate warming is 
mitigated through accelerated rates of chemical weathering. 
Agricultural sites are particularly suited for EW as they host 
the infastructure needed to apply rock powder to soils, and the 
nutrients released from rock during weathering facilitate a 
number of food security co-benefits such as increased crop 
yields [1]. 

We present results from EW field trials conducted in two 
agroecosystems under contrasting climatic conditions: (1) 
Three 1 ha plots of oil palm at the Sabahmas Oil Palm 
Plantation (Wilmar International Ltd.) in Sabah, Malaysia and 
(2) 4 ha plots of corn and miscanthus at the Energy Farm, 
University of Illinois Urbana-Champaign. The Malaysia field 
site has a tropical climate where warm wet conditions are 
predicted to drive very high weathering rates [2]. Conversely, 
the Illinois site has a continental climate, similar to the majority 
of arable land in North America and Europe. At each site 
basalt rock powder was applied at a rate of 50 tons ha-1 yr-1 
and control plots where no rock powder was applied were 
monitored as well. We use major ion concentrations and 
radiogenic Sr isotope ratios (87Sr/86Sr) of discharge, soil water, 
soil exchangeable leachates and crop biomass to quantify 
basalt chemical weathering rates and ultimately CO2 
consumption rates for each plot. We report results from three 
years of EW trials in Illinois and one year of trial in Malaysia. 
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