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Reconstructing of hydroclimate in the 

Mediterranean on orbital timescales helps improve 
our understanding the impacts of orbital forcings on 
the European regions. We collected 180 speleothem 
subsamples from Observatoire Cave (Monaco), 
Prince Cave (south France), Chateaueuf Cave (south 
France), Arago Cave (south France), and Basura 
Cave (north Italy) from 2013 to 2015. Uranium-
thorium chemistry, isotopic measurement, and 230Th 
age calculation were conducted at the High-Precision 
Mass Spectrometry and Environment Change 
Laboratory (HISPEC), Department of Geosciences, 
National Taiwan University. Speleothem age 
distribution shows that most of samples deposited at 
interglacial periods, especially in marine isotope 
stage (MIS) 1, 5, and 11. However, only a few 
samples were dated between 180 to 250 thousand 
years ago, suggesting a possible dry condition at MIS 
7, a period with different orbital parameters from 
values at  MIS 1, 5, and 11. Our results imply 
different orbital-scale hydrological influences in 
South Europe at interglacial periods. 

 


